








This volume contains hydrographs of estimated daily flows (discharges) at selected gauging 
stations on the Jubba and Shebelli rivers for varying periods between 1951 and 1989. It is 
intended to be a companion volume to the Hydrometric Data Book', but for completeness 
and ease of reference much of the Introduction to the Data Book is repeated here. All 
original data has been checked, with errors corrected and missing values infilled where 
possible. Figure 1 shows the locations of the gauging stations and Table 1 summarises their 
main hydrological characteristics 

The data checking and infilling work was carried out as part of the Somalia Hydrometry 
Project which was instituted and supported by the Overseas Development Administration 
(ODA), as part of the British Government's programme of Technical Cooperation with 
Developing Countries. Staff from Sir M. MacDonald and Partners (now part of Mott 
MacDonald International Limited) and the Institute of Hydrology provided technical 
assistance and training to the Hydrology Section of the Department of Irrigation and Land 
Use (DILU) in the Ministry of Agriculture in Mogadishu. This support was on an 
intermittent basis from late 1983 to mid 1986 and full-time from 1988 to 1990. The 
continued support of the ODA and of the Director of Irrigation and Land Use is gratefully 
acknowledged. 

Data Availability 

Some records are available from 1951 for two stations - Lugh Ganana on the river Jubba 
and Beled Weyn on the river Shebelli. These stations are the furthest upstream within 
Somalia and lie within about 50 km of the Ethiopian border. Since virtually all the river 
flow in Somalia derives from rainfall in Ethiopia (there being no significant tributaries 
within Somalia) these are very important sites for the evaluation of water resources 
available in Somalia. However, records from 1951 to 1962 are intermittent and of uncertain 
accuracy; there are no records from other stations against which th& data can be checked 
and the information about the gauge zeroes is sparse. For this period it was necessary to 
make two major assumptions: firstly that the staff gauges were at the same zero levels as 
those in use from 1963 onwards (a few file notes give good reason to support this 
assumption, particularly for Lugh Ganana), and secondly that the stage-discharge 
relationship was also the same as in the later period. Consequently, the data presented in 
this book for 1951 to 1962 is much less reliable than for later years. In general the data for 
Lugh Ganana appears to be good fiom 1951 until about 1957, but thereafter is of poor or 
very poor quality. At Beled Weyn the pattern is similar - data for the early fifties is fairly 
good but fiom 1-957 the quality deteriorates, though not to the same extent as the record 
at Lugh Ganana. 

+ Hydrometric Data Book - Jubba and Shebelli Rivers 1951 - 1989. Issued by the Somalia 
Hydrometry Project, May 1990 



















































































































































































































































































































































SOMALIA HYDROMETRY PROJECT 

River Shebelli at Audegle 
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